
 
 

 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
To: CRA Board 
From:  Gardy Laurent 

 Director of Finance and Operations 

Date: November 15, 2023 
Subject: CRA Q3 Financial Report as of September 30, 2023  

 
CRA CONSOLIDATED STATEMENT OF ACTIVITIES 
 
  

 
The table above is a comparison of the CRA’s financial position for fiscal year (FY) 2023 Quarter 3 
(Q3) versus FY 2022 Q3. As of September 2023, The Cambridge Redevelopment Authority (CRA) 
consolidated statement of activities had a Change in Net Assets of - $708,422 with a decrease in 
Investment Income due to the downturn of the financial market. Comparing August 2023 VS 
September 2023, Investment Income decreased by $407,162. Total year-to-date (YTD) income for 
FY23 was $2,247,305, a difference of $2,850,515 higher compared to Q3 of FY22 mostly because of 
investment income losses. Total expenses as of September 2023 were $2,955,727. The CRA’s 
regular income sources are Operating Income, primarily rental income for 99 Bishop Allen and the 
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Foundry (101 Rogers St), and Investment Income (i.e. Interest, dividends, investment gains/losses).  
Periodically the CRA expects income from the sale of the Development Rights in Kendall Square, and 
other miscellaneous revenue such as license agreements. Accounting adjustments for building and 
equipment for non-cash depreciation expenses were recorded this quarter for the year in the amount 
of $254,579. 
 
The CRA’s top two expense categories are the Foundry and Bishop Allen operations as depicted in 
the pie chart below. The Authority continues to operate within its budget comparing expense 
categories for budget projection vs actuals. Total projected expenditures for FY23 (Q3) were $4.2 
million and total accrued expenses as of September 2023 were $2.9 million. In June 2023, the 
organization amended its budget to account for expected proceeds from the sale of development 
rights of $68.6 million, and as of this statement date the fund has not yet been received. 
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The table below is a comparison of the CRA balance sheet for Quarter 3 FY 2023 versus FY 2022. 
The CRA’s cash, cash equivalents, and investments for FY 2023 Q3 were nearly $3 million compared 
to just under $2.9 million FY 2022 Q3 a difference of approximately $126,000.  When including other 
assets such as account receivables, loan/interest receivable, fixed assets, and other assets the CRA 
had total assets of $58.9 million as of statement date which is an increase of $ 2.2 million in total 
assets compared to FY 2022 Q3. 

The total net position for Restricted Funds, Net Assets, and Change in Net Assets had a total of 
$51,588,351, a difference of $2.2 million compared to Q3 of FY 2022. The CRA started to generate 
rent income from Bishop Allen’s operation for all months in the calendar year 2023 compared to the 
previous year. Total current liabilities for credit cards and other payables were $830,355 and with 
added long-term mortgage and deferred revenue total liabilities were $7.3 million.  
 
The CRA receives rental income for operating the Bishop Allen nonprofit office building located at 99 
Bishop Allen Drive, Cambridge, MA and the Foundry located at 101 Rogers St., Cambridge, MA. The 
next two statements of activities below break down each location’s financial operation performance. 
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BISHOP ALLEN STATEMENT OF ACTIVITIES 
 
 
Bishop Allen had a YTD income of $577,382 with a total YTD expense of $563,003 yielding a positive 
change in net assets of $14,378 after factoring in accounting entry non-cash building depreciation 
expense of $209,788. The building is fully rented with nine office spaces.  The CRA also collects 
income from the small onsite parking lot.  The solar photovoltaic system was activated in the middle 
of the year and will provide a reduction in operating expenses, which is a savings primarily passed 
along to the nonprofit tenants. 
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FOUNDRY STATEMENT OF ACTIVITIES 
 
The Foundry had a YTD total rental and operating income of $538,270 with a total YTD expense of 
$724,518 yielding a negative change in net position of $186,249. The difference has required the 
utilization of funds from the Operating Reserve.  The building has two office suites that have not been 
rented for most of the year. The CRA is also working to decrease the property tax liability of the 
building.  The CRA executed a contract with Olema Pharmaceuticals, Inc. effective September 15, 
2023 with a rent commencement date of November 15, 2023. With the execution of Olema’s lease, 
the CRA has one office suite unoccupied. 
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CLOSING STATEMENT 
 
The volatility of the financial market impacted the CRA’s investment accounts in Q3 which resulted in 
a lower change to net position. The CRA’s current investment portfolio is conservatively diversified 
with 70 percent allocation in US treasuries and 30 percent invested in state-listed stocks through the 
Division of Banks Legal List of Investment. Stringent Federal Reserve policies and the impact of 
inflation across the U.S. financial markets have a direct effect on the CRA’s portfolios.   
  
The CRA continues to research and evaluate investment opportunities that align with its goals and 
strategic plans. The CRA is preparing its budget for fiscal year 2023, which runs from January – 
December. The budget will be presented to the board during the December board meeting. 
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FINANCIAL REPORTS 
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